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Legal Description 

Beginning at a point on the southwest corner of the Certificated area. said First Point of
Beginning being the southwest corner of Section 32, Township I8S, Range 48W; thence
in a northern direction 5 miles on the western boundary of Section 32. 29. 20, 17 and 8 of
Township I 8S. Range 48W to a po int on the northwest corner of Section 8 of Township 
I8S. Range 48W: thence in an eastern direction 2 miles on the northern boundary of
Section 8 and 9 of Township I 8S, Range 48W to a point on the no11heast corner of
Section 9, Township I8S, Range 48W; thence in a southern direction I mile on the
eastern boundary Section 9. Township I 8S. Range 48W to a point on the southwest
corner of Section 9. Township l8S, Range 48W: thence in an eastern direction I mile on
the northern boundary of Section 15, Township I8S, Range 48W, to the northeast corner
of Section 15, Township I 8S, Range 48W; thence in a southern direction 2 miles on the
western boundary of Section 15 and 22 of Township I8S, Range 48W to the southeast 
corner o f Section 22, Township I 8S. Range 48W, thence in a western direction I mile on
the southern boundary of Section 22, Township 18S, Range 48W to the southwest corner
of Section 22. To,.vnship I 8S, Range 48W, thence in an southern direction 2 miles on the
eastern boundary of Section 28 and 33 of Township I 8S, Range 48W to the southeast
corner of Section 33. Township l 8S, Range 48W; thence in a western direction 2 miles in
the southern boundary of Section 33 and 32 of Township l8S, Range 48W to the First 
Point of Beginning on the southwest corner of Section 32, Township I8S, Range 48W. 

Beginning at a point on the northeast corner of the Certificated area, said Second Point of
Beginning being the northeast corner of Section 25, Township I8S, Range 44W; thence
in a southern direction I mile on the eastern boundary of Section 25. Township I 8S. 
Range 44W, to a point on the southeast corner of Section 25, Township I 8S, Range 44W;
thence in a western direction 5 miles on the southern boundary of Section 25. 26. 27. 28
and 29 o f Township I 8S. Range 44W to a point on the southwest corner o f Section 29.
Township l8S, Range 44W; thence in a southern direction I mile on the eastern 
boundary Section 3 1, Township I8S, Range 44W to a point on the southeast corner of
Section 3 1. Township 18S. Range 44W; thence in a western direction I mile on the
southern boundary o f Section 31. Township I8S. Range 44W, continuing west 2 miles on
the southern boundary of Section 36 and 35 of Townsh ip l 8S, Range 45W to the
southwest corner of Section 35. Townsh ip I8S. Range 45W; thence in a southern
direction 3 miles on the eastern boundary of Section 3, IO and 15 of Township l 9S, 
Range 45W to the southeast corner of Section 15, Townsh ip I 9S, Range 45W. thence in a
western direction 2 miles on the southern boundary of Section 15 and 16 of Township
19S. Range 45W to the southwest corner of Section 16, Township 19S, Range 45W.
thence in a northern direction I mile on the western boundary of Section 16 of Township
I 9S. Range 45W, to the northwest corner of Section 16 of Township 19S. Range 45W.
thence in a western direction I mile in the southern boundary of Section 8 of Township
I9S, Range 45W to the southwest corner of Section 8 of Township I9S, Range 45W.
thence in a northern direction 2 mi les on the western boundary o f Section 8 and 5 of 
Township I9S, Range 45W, continuing north 3 miles on the western boundary of Section
32, 29 and 20 of Township I 8S, Range 45W to the northwest corner of Section 20. 
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Township 18S, Range 45W, thence in an eastern direction 4 mi les on the northern
boundary of Section 20. 2 1, 22 and 23 of Township I8S. Range 45W to the northeast
corner of Section 23, Township 18S. Range 45W, thence in a southern direction 2 miles 
on the eastern boundary of Section 23 and 26 of Township 18S, Range 45W, to the
southeast corner of Section 26, Township I8S, Range 45W. thence in an eastern direction
I mile on the northern boundary of Section 36. Township I 8S. Range 45 W to the
northeast comer o f Section 36, Township l 8S. Range 45W, thence in a northern direction
I mile on the western boundary of Section 30, Township I8S, Range 44W to the
northwest corner of Section 30. Townsh ip 18S, Range 44W. thence in an eastern
direction 6 mi les on the northern boundary of Section 30. 29. 28, 27. 26 and 25 o f
Township l 8S. Range 44W to the Second Point of Beginning on the northeast corner of
Section 25, Township I 8S, Range 44W. 

Beginning at a point on the southeast corner of the Certi ficated area. said Third Po int of
Beginning being the southeast corner of Section 35, Township 20S, Range 43W; thence
in a western direction I mi le on the southern boundary of Section 35, Township 20S.
Range 43W, to a point on the southwest corner of Section 35, Township 20S, Range
43W; thence in a no11hem d irection I mi le on the western boundary of Section 35.
Township 20S, Range 43W to a point on the northwest corner of Section 35. Township
20S. Range 43W; thence in a western direction 4 miles on the southern boundary of
Section 27, 28, 29 and 30 of Township 20S, Range 43W to a point on the southwest
corner of Section 30, Township 20S, Range 43W; thence in a southern direction I mile 
on the eastern boundary of Section 36, Township 20S, Range 44W, to the southeast
corner of Section 36. Township 20S. Range 44W; thence in a western direction 3 miles 
on the southern boundary of Section 36, 35 and 34 of Township 20S, Range 44W, to the
southwest corner of Section 34. Township 20S, Range 44W. thence in a no11hern 
direction 2 miles on the western boundary of Section 34 and 27 of Township 20S, Range 
44W to the no11hwest corner of Section 27. Township 20S. Range 44W. thence in an
eastern direction I mi le on the northern boundary of Section 27. Township 20S, Range 
44W, to the northeast corner of Section 27, Township 20S, Range 44W. thence in a
northern direction 2 m iles on the western boundary of Section 23 and 14 of Townsh ip
20S. Range 44W to the northwest corner of Section 14 of Township 20S. Range 44 W.
thence in an eastern direction 2 miles on the northern boundary of Section 14 and 13 of
Township 20S. Range 44W, continui ng east 3 miles on the northern boundary of Section
18. 17 and 16 of Township 20S. Range 43W to the northeast corner of Section 16. 
Township 20S. Range 43W. thence in a northern direction 2 mi les on the western 
boundary of Section IO and 3 of Township 20S, Range 43W to the northwest corner of
Section 3, Township 20S, Range 43W, thence in an eastern direction 2 miles on the
northern boundary of Section 3 and 2 of Township 20S, Range 43W. to the northeast 
corner of Section 2. Townsh ip 20S. Range 43W. thence in a southern direction I mile on
the eastern boundary of Section 2, Township 20S, Range 43W to the southeast corner of
Section 2, Township 20S, Range 43W, thence in an eastern direction 2 miles on the
northern boundary o f Section 12 of Township 20S. Range 43W and Section 7 of
Township 20S. Range 42W to the northeast comer of Section 7 of Township 20S. Range
42W, thence in a southern direction I mile on the eastern boundary of Section 7 of
Township 20S. Range 43W to the southeast corner of Section 7 o f Township 20S, Range 
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42W, thence in a western direction 2 miles on the southern boundary of Section 7 of 
Township 20S. Range 42W and Section 12 of Township 20S, Range 43W to the 
southwest corner of Section 12. Townsh ip 20S, Range 43 W, thence in a southern 
direction 4 miles on the eastern boundary of Section 14, 23, 26 and 35 of Township 20S. 
Range 43 W to the Third Point of Beginning on the southeast corner of Section 35, 
Township 20S, Range 43W. 

Beginning at a point on the southeast corner of the Certificated area, said Fourth Po int of 
Beginning being the southeast corner of Section 32, Township 20S, Range 41 W; thence 
in a western direction 1.3 mi les on the southern boundary of Sections 32 and 31 of 
Township 20S, Range 41 W, continuing west 2 miles on the southern boundary of 
Sections 36 and 35 of Township 20S, Range 42W to a point on the southwest corner o f 
Section 35, Township 20S, Range 42W; thence in a northern direction I mile on the 
western boundary of Section 35, Township 20S, Range 42W to a point on the northwest 
comer of Section 35, Township 20S, Range 42W; thence in an eastern direction 2 miles 
on the northern boundary of Sections 35 and 36 ofTownship 20S, Range 42W continuing 
east 1.3 miles on the northern boundary of Sections 31 and 32 of Township 20S, Range 
41 W to the northeast corner of Section 32, Township 20S, Range 41 W thence in a 
southern direction I mile on the eastern boundary of Section 32, township 20S, Range 
41 W to the Fourth Point of Beginning on the southeast comer of Section 32, Township 
20S, Range 41 W. 
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